
TYPE OF EQUIPMENT
 MUSTANG RENTAL 

SERVICES 
HERTZ Equipment Rental NEFF Rental

 Blue Line Rental 

(Formally Volvo Rents) 

1 BACKHOE/LOADER - 62 HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat 416F JD310KJ/ CASE 580N JD310K / CASE 580N Volvo BL-60

MONTHLY $945.00 $1,850.00 $1,675.00 $1,850.00

WEEKLY $315.00 $550.00 $640.00 $750.00

DAILY $105.00 $220.00 $255.00 $260.00

2
SMALL CRAWLER TRACTOR    

W/6 WAY BLADE, 64HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat D3K XL JD 450 JD450J John Deere 450

MONTHLY $1,975.00 $2,925.00 $3,080.00 $3,600.00

WEEKLY $658.00 $950.00 $1,165.00 $1,250.00

DAILY $219.00 $320.00 $450.00 $430.00

3
CRAWLER TYPE TRACTOR, 

80HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat D4K XL JD 550 BobCat S220 John Deere 550

MONTHLY $2,310.00 $3,195.00 $1,380.00 $4,050.00

WEEKLY $770.00 $1,185.00 $550.00 $1,400.00

DAILY $257.00 $350.00 $220.00 $485.00

4
CRAWLER TYPE TRACTOR,    

140HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat D6N XL; OROPS John Deere 750

MONTHLY $4,752.00 $7,700.00

WEEKLY $1,584.00 $2,550.00

DAILY $528.00 $870.00

5 SCRAPER - 11 CUBIC YDS

MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

6 SCRAPER - 17 CUBIC YDS

MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

7 SCRAPER - 22 CUBIC YDS

MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

8
CRAWLER TYPE TRACTOR, 

L.G.P., 140 HP 

MAKE/MODEL Cat D6N LGP; OROPS

MONTHLY $4,320.00

WEEKLY $1,440.00

DAILY $480.00

9
DISC PLOWS - 36 HINGE 

OFFSET

MAKE/MODEL Rome TRH-1630

MONTHLY $1,815.00

WEEKLY $605.00

DAILY $202.00

10
CRAWLER TYPE LOADER            

1-1/2 YRD BKT, 80 HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat 953D BobCat T300

MONTHLY $5,390.00 $2,275.00

WEEKLY $1,797.00 $865.00

DAILY $599.00 $320.00

11
WHEELED TYPE LOADER           

1-1/2 YD BKT, 80 HP 

MAKE/MODEL Cat 924K JD 210K Volvo L50 Art. Loader

MONTHLY $2,310.00 $1,650.00 $3,600.00

WEEKLY $770.00 $550.00 $1,200.00

DAILY $257.00 $180.00 $410.00

12
PNEUMATIC ROLLER, 18 

TONS, 9 WHEELS

MAKE/MODEL Cat PS150C; 14 Tons PT125R Ingersoil

MONTHLY $1,760.00 $2,775.00

WEEKLY $587.00 $1,100.00

DAILY $196.00 $410.00

13
SOIL COMPACTOR, 

VIBRATORY, PADDED 

DRUM,  84"- 25 TONS

No Bid

No Bid

Bid # 2015-33R

 March 17, 2015 through March 16, 2016

HEAVY MACHINERY RENTAL
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TYPE OF EQUIPMENT
 MUSTANG RENTAL 

SERVICES 
HERTZ Equipment Rental NEFF Rental

 Blue Line Rental 

(Formally Volvo Rents) 

MAKE/MODEL Cat CP56 Volvo SD-100D Padfoot Hamm 3410 w/shell kit

MONTHLY $3,045.00 $4,125.00 $2,980.00 $4,600.00

WEEKLY $1,015.00 $1,465.00 $1,140.00 $1,550.00

DAILY $338.00 $3,650.00 $425.00 $510.00

14
SOIL COMPACTOR, 

VIBRATORY, SMOOTH 

DRUM, 84" -  25 TONS
MAKE/MODEL Cat CS56 Volvo SD-100D Cat Class Hamm 3410

MONTHLY $2,970.00 $3,650.00 $2,830.00 $4,600.00

WEEKLY $990.00 $1,230.00 $1,080.00 $1,550.00

DAILY $330.00 $380.00 $400.00 $510.00

15
ASPHALT RECYCLER, 

BOMAG MPH 100 OR 

EQUIVALENT
MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

16 PULVER MIXER

MAKE/MODEL Cat RM300 Soil Stab Only

MONTHLY $7,790.00

WEEKLY $2,597.00

DAILY $886.00

17
WATER TRUCK, 1200 - 2000 

GALLON CAPACITY

MAKE/MODEL F750 Water Truck; 2000 Gallon IH 4200; 2000 Gal. Ford F650 Water Truck, 2000 Gal. 2000 Gal. Water Truck

MONTHLY $1,800.00 $1,995.00 $2,310.00 $3,800.00

WEEKLY $600.00 $795.00 $875.00 $1,250.00

DAILY $200.00 $245.00 $330.00 $410.00

18 MOTOR GRADER, 135 HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat 120M Volvo G940

MONTHLY $4,725.00 $5,400.00

WEEKLY $1,575.00 $2,100.00

DAILY $525.00 $735.00

19
EXCAVATOR, 26 TONS  1 3/8 

YARD BUCKET

MAKE/MODEL Cat 320E LRR Komatsu PC240 LC Kobelco SK210-8; Doosan DX225-LC Volvo EC 220

MONTHLY $4,095.00 $6,165.00 $4,475.00 $6,000.00

WEEKLY $1,365.00 $2,240.00 $1,710.00 $2,250.00

DAILY $455.00 $735.00 $665.00 $760.00

20
SELF-PROPELLED 

MECHANICAL BROOM

MAKE/MODEL Broce RJ350 Broce RJT350 Broce 3 wheeled

MONTHLY $1,418.00 $1,620.00 $2,000.00

WEEKLY $473.00 $700.00 $650.00

DAILY $158.00 $255.00 $225.00

21
TAMPER MAKE - BOMAG BT 

58 VIBRATOR (OR EQUIV)

MAKE/MODEL MultiQuip MTX70 MultiQuip

MONTHLY $378.00 $450.00 $585.00

WEEKLY $126.00 $179.00 $195.00

DAILY $42.00 $68.00 $65.00

22
CAT D6D (OR EQUIV) 140 HP 

CLEARING DOZER W/RAKE 

MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY $6,930.00

WEEKLY $2,310.00

DAILY $770.00

23
RAMMAX (OR EQUIV) 

TRENCH COMP-WALK 

BEHIND-24/33
MAKE/MODEL Stone TR24 Wacker RTX JC2

MONTHLY $1,320.00 $1,220.00 $1,855.00 $1,800.00

WEEKLY $440.00 $465.00 $620.00 $600.00

DAILY $147.00 $155.00 $232.00 $210.00

24
RAMMAX (OR EQUIV) 

TRENCH COMP-REMOTE-

24/33
MAKE/MODEL Stone R34 Wacker RT82-SC

MONTHLY $1,320.00 $1,350.00 $1,855.00 $1,800.00

WEEKLY $440.00 $490.00 $620.00 $600.00

DAILY $147.00 $175.00 $232.00 $210.00

25 AIR COMPR - 185 CFM  

MAKE/MODEL Airman 185 Atlas Copco XAS185JD Doosan C185WKUB-T41 Kaeser 185

MONTHLY $300.00 $450.00 $550.00 $725.00

WEEKLY $100.00 $165.00 $225.00 $300.00

DAILY $35.00 $65.00 $85.00 $110.00

26
SKID STEER LOADER 

(BOBCAT)-5YD BUCK 

W/TRACK
MAKE/MODEL Cat 259B Bobcat T650 Bobcat T-190 Bobcat T-190 / JD 319
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TYPE OF EQUIPMENT
 MUSTANG RENTAL 

SERVICES 
HERTZ Equipment Rental NEFF Rental

 Blue Line Rental 

(Formally Volvo Rents) 

MONTHLY $1,440.00 $1,775.00 $2,310.00 $2,700.00

WEEKLY $480.00 $645.00 $885.00 $1,050.00

DAILY $160.00 $235.00 $325.00 $310.00

27
Skid steer Loader (Bobcat)-5YD 

BUCK W/Wheels

MAKE/MODEL Cat 226B Bobcat S 185 BobCat S175 Volvo MC 110

MONTHLY $900.00 $995.00 $1,705.00 $1,875.00

WEEKLY $300.00 $395.00 $655.00 $625.00

DAILY $100.00 $165.00 $245.00 $200.00

28
RUBBER TIRE LOADER 

W/HAMMERS - 1000# IE

MAKE/MODEL Cat 416E w/ H90 Hammer Bobcat 185 w/Breaker JD 310 w/Hammer Volvo BL 60 w/Breaker

MONTHLY $3,060.00 $1,900.00 $4,250.00 $4,550.00

WEEKLY $1,020.00 $795.00 $1,500.00 $1,875.00

DAILY $340.00 $290.00 $630.00 $645.00

29
LOW GROUND PRESSURE 

TRACTOR, 80 HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat D4K LGP JD 550 LGP JD 550J

MONTHLY $2,700.00 $3,195.00 $3,250.00

WEEKLY $900.00 $1,195.00 $1,225.00

DAILY $300.00 $380.00 $475.00

30
LOW GROUND PRESSURE 

TRACTOR 90HP 

MAKE/MODEL Cat DK5 LGP JD 650 LGP JD 650J

MONTHLY $3,040.00 $3,495.00 $4,310.00

WEEKLY $1,013.00 $1,295.00 $1,625.00

DAILY $338.00 $395.00 $625.00

31
SPECIALTY EXCAVATOR-

LONG REACH 60', 48' 

DEPTH
MAKE/MODEL Cat 324E Long Reach Komatsu PC270LC-8

MONTHLY $7,470.00 $8,485.00

WEEKLY $2,490.00 $3,250.00

DAILY $830.00 $1,250.00

32
SPECIALTY EXCAVATORS 

W/THUMB ATTACH

MAKE/MODEL Cat 320D w/Thumb JD 200 Komatsu PC270LC-8 w/Thumb Volvo EW 180C Wheeled-Special Freight to be applied as extra expence

MONTHLY $4,295.00 $4,695.00 $8,790.00 $6,750.00

WEEKLY $1,432.00 $1,595.00 $3,365.00 $2,250.00

DAILY $477.00 $535.00 $1,295.00 $760.00

33
PAVING BREAKERS - 90 LB 

(AIR OPERATED)

MAKE/MODEL Sullair 90# APT 190 Atlas Copco TEXP905 90lb Air Hammer

MONTHLY $180.00 $225.00 $310.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $60.00 $95.00 $120.00 $150.00

DAILY $20.00 $35.00 $45.00 $50.00

34 Reach Lift; 6000LB Capacity

MAKE/MODEL Cat TL642 JLD G6-42A Genie GTH644 Genie 636

MONTHLY $1,595.00 $1,950.00 $1,720.00 $2,750.00

WEEKLY $532.00 $800.00 $665.00 $930.00

DAILY $177.00 $275.00 $250.00 $310.00

35
Mini Excavator, 18 HP, 6' 10" 

Depth

MAKE/MODEL Cat 301.8C Bobcat 325 IHI 25VX-3 Volvo EC20 - 4000LB Class

MONTHLY $1,100.00 $1,345.00 $1,265.00 $1,575.00

WEEKLY $367.00 $595.00 $490.00 $525.00

DAILY $122.00 $155.00 $190.00 $185.00

36
Mini Excavator, 30HP, 9' 11" 

Depth

MAKE/MODEL Cat 303.5E-CR Bobcat 331 IHI 35N-3 EC35/38 - 7000LB Class

MONTHLY $1,200.00 $1,350.00 $1,425.00 $1,800.00

WEEKLY $400.00 $605.00 $550.00 $630.00

DAILY $135.00 $165.00 $225.00 $220.00

37 EXCAVATOR; 39 TON, 270HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat 336E Komatsu PC360LC Komatsu PC360LC-10 Volvo EC290 - 70,000LB Class

MONTHLY $7,560.00 $8,400.00 $7,715.00 $7,500.00

WEEKLY $2,520.00 $2,995.00 $3,065.00 $2,500.00

DAILY $840.00 $995.00 $1,210.00 $860.00

38

SPECIALTY 24 TON 

EXCAVATOR W/ 5000 # 

HAMMER

MAKE/MODEL Cat 320 E w/Hammer JD 225DLC w/5000LB HammerKobelco SK210-9 w/ 5000lb Stanley Hammer Volvo EC220 w/Breaker

MONTHLY $11,500.00 $11,997.00 $10,530.00 $11,850.00

WEEKLY $3,833.00 $4,940.00 $3,635.00 $4,200.00

DAILY $1,278.00 $1,660.00 $1,395.00 $1,450.00

39
Crawler Dozer; 200 HP, Streaight 

w/Tilt Blade

MAKE/MODEL Cat D6T XL; OROPS

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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TYPE OF EQUIPMENT
 MUSTANG RENTAL 

SERVICES 
HERTZ Equipment Rental NEFF Rental

 Blue Line Rental 

(Formally Volvo Rents) 

MONTHLY $7,500.00

WEEKLY $2,500.00

DAILY $835.00

40
25 Ton Articulated Off Road 

Truck; 309HP

MAKE/MODEL Cat 725

MONTHLY $7,600.00

WEEKLY $2,533.00

DAILY $844.00

41
TELESCOPIC FORKLIFT; 9000 # 

43" LIFT, 31' 5" REACH

MAKE/MODEL Cat TL943 JLG G9 CAT TL943 Genie 1056 10,000LB Reachlift

MONTHLY $1,800.00 $2,450.00 $2,650.00 $3,800.00

WEEKLY $600.00 $890.00 $1,010.00 $1,425.00

DAILY $200.00 $305.00 $380.00 $485.00

42
MAN BUCKET (work basket) 

48"X48"/WITH TOP COVER

MAKE/MODEL

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

43
ATTACHMENTS FOR SKID 

STEER LOADER

a. 72" ANGLE BLADE

MONTHLY $750.00

WEEKLY $250.00

DAILY $85.00

b. COLD PLANER

MONTHLY $2,340.00 $2,250.00

WEEKLY $780.00 $775.00

DAILY $260.00 $260.00

Purchase Price of Bid $336 for Complete Set No Bid

c. 72" GRAPPLE BUCKET

MONTHLY $350.00 $315.00 $750.00

WEEKLY $125.00 $125.00 $250.00

DAILY $40.00 $50.00 $85.00

d. GRAPPLE FORKS

MONTHLY $450.00 $200.00

WEEKLY $150.00 $80.00

DAILY $50.00 $30.00

e. HYDRAULIC AUGER

MONTHLY $720.00

WEEKLY $240.00

DAILY $80.00

i 6" BIT

MONTHLY $400.00 $352.00 $140.00

WEEKLY $135.00 $141.00 $55.00

DAILY $45.00 $41.00 $20.00

ii 9" BIT

MONTHLY $400.00 $337.00 $140.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $135.00 $167.00 $55.00 $150.00

DAILY $45.00 $41.00 $20.00 $50.00

iii 12" BIT

MONTHLY $400.00 $347.00 $140.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $135.00 $92.00 $55.00 $150.00

DAILY $45.00 $30.00 $20.00 $50.00

iv 18" BIT

MONTHLY $400.00 $324.00 $140.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $135.00 $160.00 $55.00 $150.00

DAILY $45.00 $41.00 $20.00 $50.00

v 24" BIT

MONTHLY $400.00 $337.00 $140.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $135.00 $153.00 $55.00 $150.00

MONTHLY $45.00 $40.00 $20.00 $50.00

vi 12" AUGER EXTENSION

MONTHLY $45.00 $347.00 $85.00 $105.00

WEEKLY $15.00 $162.00 $35.00 $45.00

DAILY $5.00 $43.00 $15.00 $15.00

vii 48" AUGER EXTENSION

MONTHLY $90.00 $432.00 $85.00

WEEKLY $30.00 $162.00 $35.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bit Price Includes Auger, (1) 

one Bit and (1) one Extension

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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TYPE OF EQUIPMENT
 MUSTANG RENTAL 

SERVICES 
HERTZ Equipment Rental NEFF Rental

 Blue Line Rental 

(Formally Volvo Rents) 

DAILY $10.00 $47.00 $15.00

f. 300 # HYDRAULIC HAMMER

MONTHLY $550.00 $905.00 $995.00 $1,575.00

WEEKLY $185.00 $400.00 $385.00 $525.00

DAILY $62.00 $125.00 $140.00 $185.00

g. HYDRAULIC TRENCHER

MONTHLY $600.00 $945.00

WEEKLY $200.00 $370.00

DAILY $67.00 $135.00

h. LANDSCAPE TILLER

MONTHLY $1,050.00

WEEKLY $350.00

DAILY $117.00

i. 84" MATERIAL HANDLING ARM

MONTHLY $347.00

WEEKLY $116.00

DAILY $39.00

j. 66" MULTI-PURP. BUCKET

MONTHLY $743.00 $115.00

WEEKLY $248.00 $45.00

DAILY $83.00 $20.00

k. 750# CAP. PALLET FORKS

MONTHLY $114.00 $200.00 $350.00 $450.00

WEEKLY $38.00 $75.00 $145.00 $150.00

DAILY $13.00 $25.00 $60.00 $50.00

l. 72" PICK-UP BROOM

MONTHLY $1,087.00 $370.00

WEEKLY $362.00 $145.00

DAILY $121.00 $55.00

m. STUMP GRINDER

MONTHLY

WEEKLY

DAILY

44
FREIGHT CHARGE                         

(Loaded Mile or Round Trip)

< 100 HP = $100/Delivery & 

$100/Return > 100 HP = 

$150/delivery & $150/Return

$96/Loaded Mile $4.50/Loaded Mile

 $75.00 for delivery / $75.00 

for pick up - Over weight 

items Cost will be assessed 

at time of order 

45
DELIVERY COMPLETION 

(approximate Days)
2 hrs - 2 days after order 1 day after order 1 day after order

 1 day after order Depending 

on Availability 

46
ADDRESS & LOCATION 

NEAREST BRANCH OFFICE

 8206 W SH 21                            

Bryan, TX  77807 

 777 I-45 South                           

Conroe, TX  77301 

 12949 N Hwy 183(Research 

Blvd)  Austin, TX  78750 

 1395 North Harvey Mitchell 

Pkwy  Bryan, TX 77803 

47
BILLABLE MILES

2 Miles No Bid 90 Miles No Bid

Emergency Contact Information

 Lance Feldhousen  979-775-7368 or 

281-414-0029 OR Todd Brewer  936-

520-4255 

 Deryl Roberts 936-714-6364 or 

936-441-0501 

 Ronald Riding - Branch Manager  

512-335-5171 

 Monday - Friday 7-5:                           

979-775-9173                               

After Hours: 979-220-7362 

48
MINIMUM RENTAL

1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day

49

CHARGE FOR RAIN DAYS

No, if notified by 8:00 am Each Day

 Yes, Rental rate is for each 

day/week/month that the equipment 

is rented by customer 

 Rain Days are built into the weekly 

and Monthly Rates 
YES

50
EMERGENCY RESPONSE TIME

.5 - 2 Hours 8-10 Hours 4 Hours
 1-3 Hours depending on 

location 

 Sample Contract Attached - Legal will 

need to review 
None

 Sample contract is attached - 

Legal will need to review. County 

will be held responsible for 

vandalism if happens.  Vendor 

mentions in contract; county ins. 

may pay for damages. 

 Vendor does not agree to Section G 

of the Contract; Monthly cost will 

constist of 28 days of rental instead 

of 30 dya sof rental as written in 

Contract; And Special Freight will be 

applied to overweight items but 

vendor did not give amount. 

Approved by Commissioner’s Court on this ________ day of _______________, 2015 by

_________________________________ holding the position of _______________________________

Recommendation:  Award to Mustang Rental with the exception of

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

Exceptions to the Bid

                                     Sections 5, 6, 7, 15, 42 and 43m:  3 Quotes Required

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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