
Section Product Estimated Quanity Per Gallon Total Per Gallon Total

1 AE-Prime 20,000 GAL $2.9498 $58,996.00 $3.2194 $64,388.00

2 CRS-2 Cationic Emulsion 15,000 GAL $2.2998 $34,497.00 $2.5194 $37,791.00

3 CRS-2P Cationic Emulsion 20,000 GAL $2.8798 $57,596.00 $2.9894 $59,788.00

4
CHFRS-2P Cationic High Float 

Emulsion 20,000 GAL
no bid no bid $3.0394 $60,788.00

5 CSS-1 Cationic Emulsion 10,000 GAL $2.2998 $22,998.00 $2.6019 $26,019.00

6 AES 300 Emulsion 10,000 GAL $2.5598 $25,598.00 $2.9536 $29,536.00

7
RC250 Rapid Curing Cutback 

Asphalt 10,000 GAL
$3.8598 $38,598.00 no bid no bid

8 Pump Charge-Cleaning of Tanks

9 FREE TIME Per Hour

10 DEMURRAGE  Per Hour

11 Minimum Delivery

RECOMMENDATION: Primary Vendors: Cleveland Asphalt: Sections 1, 2, 3, 5, 6 & 7

Ergon Asphalt:  Sections 4

Approved by Commissioner’s Court on this ________ day of _______________, 2014 by

_________________________________ holding the position of _______________________________

    

Previously known as 2014-12

Ergon Asphalt

$80.00

two (2) hours

Bid Tabulation 2014-83R

Asphalts, Oils and Emulsions Products

December 1, 2014 through November 30, 2015

no bid no bid

$80.00 Per Load of 5,000 Gal $80.00 Per Load of 5,500 GAL

$80.00

two (2) hours

Cleveland Ashpalt Products


