Bid # 2014-52 Various Aggregate and Cold Mix

Tabulation

June 25, 2014 through June 24, 2015

BRAZOS PAVING VULCAN STATEWIDE MATERIALS MARTIN MARIETTA KNIFE RIVER
Cold Mix Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled Loaded/ Hauled| Loaded/ Hauled Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled)| Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled
Hauled to County Yard Anywhere in | to County Yard Hauled to County Yard Hauled to County Yard Hauled to County Yard
Loaded Only | snvherein | onHwy21 | Loaded Only County onHwyz1 | LoadedOnly [ rein | onHwy2n [ LoadedOnly | priharein | onkwy21 | LoadedOnly | apiiierein | onHwy21
County County County County
Item Tonnage Description Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
1 5,000 TxDOT 330 Type |, Grade AA, Course Base H NO BID H NO BID S NO BID 5 34.00 5 76.00 s 75.00 s NO BID s NO BID 5 NO BID 5 38.00 B 82.95 s 79.08 S NO BID H NO BID 5 NO BID
Product Name TVPE AA Cold Mix
Product Number #3656
2 4,000 TxDOT 330 Type |, Grade CC, Medium Surface S NOBID [$ NOBID [$ NOBID [§ 3500 |$ 77.00 [ 7600 |5 NOBID |5 NOBID |5 MNOBD |5 3700 [$ 8195 [5 7808 [$ NOBID |5 NOBID [$ NOBID
Product Name Type CC Cold Mix
Product Number #3659
3 4,000 TxDOT 330 Type Il, Grade C5, Medium Surface S NOBID |5 NOBID |$ NOBID |§ 3600 | S 7800 [ 7600 |5 NOBD |5 NOBID |5 NOBID |5 3700 [$ 8195 |5 7808 |5 NOBID |5 NOBID |5 NOBID

Product Name

Type CS Cold Mix

Various Materials

= T
Surface Aggregates Loaded/ |Loaded/ Hauled| Loaded,/ Hauled [ Loaded/ Hauled Loaded/ [Loaded/ Hauled Loaded/  |Loaded/ Haule: Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled
g Hauled to County Yard Anywherein | to County Yard Hauled to County Yard Hauled to County Yard Hauled to County Yard
loaded Only | oo wherein | onkHwy2a | loadedOnly County onkwy21 | 109edOnlY | o herein | onHwy21 | '029EdONN | o iherein | onkwy2r | 102990 | aniuherain | onHwy.21
County County County County
Item Tonnage Description Per Tan Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Tan Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
Aggregate Tx DOT [tem 302,
4 1,000 TypeD, Grade 3 SAC-B
(Limestone) $ NOBD |5 woBD [$ moBID |$ NOBID | $ NOBD | $ woBD |5 wmNosD s wNoBio |$ nNoBD |5 NOBD |$  wNOBID |5 NOBID |$ 25.52 $ 30.77 3 28.97
Product Name Colorado Grade 3
Product Number 39883
Aggregate TxDOT Item 302,
5 5000  TypeD Grade 4 SAC-B
{Limestone) 5 NO BID 5 NO BID 3 NO BID s NO BID S NO BID S NO BID S NO BID S NO BID S NO BID 5 NO BID S NO BID $ NO BID $ 25.52 s 30.77 $ 2877
Product Name Colorado Grade 4
Product Number 39881
Aggregate TxDOT Item 302,
] 500 Type PD Grade 4 SAC-B
{Precoated Limestone| 3 NO BID S NO BID S NOBID $ NO BID S NO BID $ NO BID 5 NO BID $ NO BID 5 NO BID s NOBID 5 NO BID S NO BID S NO BID S NO BID $ NO BID
Product Name
Product Number
Aggregate Tx DOT Item 302,
7 1,000  TypeD, Grade 5 SAC-B
{Limestone) ¢ mnoBiD |$ moeD |5 woeiD |$  woBD |$  nNoBD |S$  noBID s  mMoBIO |5 mommp |5 MOBID S  NMOBID |$ NOBID |5 NOBID |$ 3117 [§ 3642 $ 34.42
- Product Name Colorado Grade §
Product Number 39884
. Lsoo  AEeregateTxDOT Item 302,
) Typel, Grade 4 £} NO BID $ NO BID 5 NO BID $ NO BID s NO BID $ NO BID B NO BID S NO BID S NO BID $ NO BID 5 NO BID S NO BID $ NOBID S NO BID S NO BID
Product Name
Product Number
Aggregate Tx DOT Item 302, Type E, Grade 5
] 500 Traprock of various fine grained, dense, dark-
colored, non-granite, igneous rock $ NO BID B NOBID 5 NO BID 5 19.00 B 56.50 5 56.00 8 NO BID 5 NO BID 5 NO BID s NO BID 5 NO BID S NO BID H NO BID s NO BID 5 NO BID
Product Name Traprack

Product Number

Loaded/ |Loaded/ Hauled

i i
Loaded/ Hauled | Loaded/ Hauled

Loaded/ Hauled

Loaded/ Loaded/ Hauled

Loaded/

Loaded/ Hauled

to perform the specified work in the bid

for trucking

none

i d to C Yard Yard
Loadsd Rk Hauled | toCounty¥ard| | 00 Anywherein [ to CountyYard | | Lo Hauled e CountyYard |\ only Hauled |toCountyVard| | . 0o Hauled | to County Yar
Anywherein | onHwy.21 County on Hwy.21 Anywherein | on Hwy.21 Anywherein | onHwy21 Anywhere in on Hwy.21
County County County County
Item Tonnage Description Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ten PerTon Per Ton Per Tan Per Ton Per Tan Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
10 3,000 1 1/2"Backiill Aggregate 5 NOBID |$ NOBID |$ NOBID |5 NOBID |$ NOBID |5 nNOBID |3 nOBID [$ NOBID |$ nNOBID 5 WOBID |$5 mNOBID |$ NOBID fS 2219 |5 2744 $ 25.44
Product Name Hansen Grade 2
Froduc! Number 39243
11 3,000 1 1/2"Concrete Aggregate $  NOBID Is NO BID \ $ NOBID |$ NOBID |5  NOBID ‘ 5 NOBID |$ 13.00 | $ 2160 J $ 2450 |5 MOBID |$ NO BID is NOBID |$  NOBID |$ NOBID | $ NOBID
|Product Name Little River 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregates
Product Number
12 2,000 Li Screenings S NOBID | S NOBID J $ MNOBID |$ NOBID J 5 NOBID [ 5 NOBID _|$ 4.00 ls 2175 {5 2475 |5 NOBID |$ NO BID 15 NOBID |$  17.07 Js 2232 | $ 2032
Product Name TCS 7Mesh Dry Screenings Calorado Dry Screenings
Product Number 268 39298
13 2.000  Washed Concreta Sand 5 NOBID | 5 NOBID ! $ NOBID |$ NOBID J 5 NOBID [ 5 NOBID |S 6.50 |$ 14.50 Is 17.50 [$ NOBID ls NO BID Is NOBID |$ 8.25 IS 14.50 | $ 12.50
Product Name Little River Concrete Sand River Bend Washed Conctete Sand
Product Number 39100
Riprap - TxDOT Item 432, Type
14 2000 F 5 nNOBID |$ NOBID |5 noBD |$ nNoBID |$  noBD [$ womD |$ moBD [$§ nNoBD |4 nNoBID [$ nOBID |$ NOBID |$ woBiD f$ 2700 |$ mNoBmiD [$ 46.00
Product Name Sky High 18 x 24 Rip Rap
Product Number 39266
Riprap - TXDOT ltem 432, Type |
15 2000 R $ mNoBD |$ NOBD |$ NOBID |3 NOBID S NOBID [S NOBID |§ NOBID |$ NOBID |5 NOBID S5 NOBID |$ NOBID 5 NOBID [5 2700 |5 NOBID |$ 46.00
Product Name Sky High 12 x 18 Rip Rap
Product Number 39222
Riprap - TxDOT Item 432,
16 2,000  Common $ NOBID |$ NOBID |5 wnoBD |$S NOBID |$  wNOBID [§ NOBID |$ NOBD |% NOBID [$ MOBID [S NOBID |5 NOBID |5 NOBID |$§ NOBID |5 NOBID $ NO BID
Product Name
Product Number
17 2,000 Oversize Aggregate-2x 3 $  NOBID |s NO BID |5 NOBID |$  nOBID I S NOBID | $  NOoBID |$ 1200 |$ 29.75 | $ 3375 |5 NOBID Is NO BID ]s NOBID |§ 2497 | 5 3022 l $ 28.22
Product Name TC51x3 Colorado 2 x 3 Oversized
Product Number TCS 003 39622
18 2,000 Oversize Aggregate- 3% 5 s NO BID |$ NO BID |$ NO BID H NO BID I $ NO BID l S NO BID s 12.00 Is 29.75 %s 33.75 S NO BID Is NO BID H NO BID ] 24.97 |s 30.22 | s 28.22
Product Name TCS 3%5 Colorado 3 x 5 Oversized
Product Number TCS 005 39181
19 30,000 Flex Base - Item 247, Type D, Grade 1 $ 1500 |$ 21.50 |$ 19.50 $ _ NOBID | $  NOBID [ $  NOBID _|$  MNOBID | 5 NOBID ‘ $  NoBD |5 wNOBID NO BID Is nogip  |$ 1620 |$ 22.45 1 5 20.45
Product Name Type D, Grade 1 River Bend Crushed Concrete
Product Number 23 39491
Little River Materials, 970 CR 253, Cameron TX &
20 Specific location of vendors plant 7601 Hwy 21 West, Bryan TX Disitsey, T = fvét 3::}:’:”'0* KIPP2. | Texas Crushed Stone, 5300 IH 35N. Georgetown, 4483 Ranch Rd, 1022, Ulvade, TX 78801 6310 Hwy 21 W. Bryan, TX 77807
B TX
21 Delivery time after receipt of purchase order 3 days 10 days open 1day 5 days
22 Contact person & phone number at plant Ernest Alvarado @ 979-412-5137 Gary Eagle @ 830-278-6205 Randy Meachen @ 512-279-7625 Magda @ 830-591-1887 Vernon Havemann @ 979-567-1192
Huwy 21 West, turn left Into BPI Drive @ first left FESEREWAR 2GRl ke 1 wibodH 3 et
23 Directions to plant westinghouse on left / Little River=6 N. and left
after Thompson Creek Bridge
on 485, left on 254, right on 253
34 Number of Trucks and size owned by vendor 100 trucks, 25 tons each 110 tractor trailers owned or leased 20Trucks (contract maoriet) & a4 60 company trucks & 60 leased trucks
S bobtails, 2 end dumps + avallable leased trucks ton end dumps
- Describe any agreements that vendor has In place to insure ability |BP| owns the material and has agreements in place

Recommended Award: Primary:

Secondary:

urt on this

Vulcan: tems 1,2,3 & 9

Knife River: Items 4,5,7, 10,12,13,14,15,17 & 18

BPI: Item 19

Martin Marietta: Items 1,2 &3
Knife River: Item 19
Statewide: Items 12, 13, 17 & 18

o Award: Items 6, 8, 11 & 16

day of

the position of

2014 by




