BID TABULATION 2014-02

CULVERTS, VARIOUS TYPES
January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014
EST Contech Engineered | CPR Services and
ITEM QTy ‘:‘r"‘:’ds"é‘am‘;s:f Solutions Supply  New
NO IN FEET > J Houston, TX Caney, TX
Galv Steel Corr Culv & Corr Poly Plast Pipe STOCK | ORDER | STOCK | ORDER | STOCK | ORDER
1 15" 16 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination $9.73 $12.35 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid  $7.61 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination $9.53 | - $7.14 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid - $7.14 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $102.25 ' No Bid
2 18" 16 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert 500 . e
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination :
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid - $9.13 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination $11.29 | $8.17 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier $8.
Sloped Ends, Pair
3 24" 16 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $12.90 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination $15.08 | $11.87 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $11.87 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $164.95 $121.00 No Bid
4 36" 16 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert sc0 | = . -
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination $2 $31.84 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $26.14 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination $22.72 | $17.15 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $17.15 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $185.12 No Bid
5 48" 14 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert, 3 X 1 Cor 630 ] ]
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid _$61.99 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $39.18 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $35.89 - $34.12 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid %3412 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $541.23 $497.00 No Bid
6 60" 12 émaTlge Round Spiral Culvert, 3 X 1 Cor 120
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $109.00 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $66.90 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $72.37 $59.97 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $59.97 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $1,161.86 $1,067.00
7__ |72 12 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert, 3 X 1 Cor 780 Sy g e e
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $127.87 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $80.17 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $88.66 $72.75 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $72.75 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $1,659.79 $1,319.00 No Bid
8 |84" 12 Gauge Round Spiral Culvert, 3 X 1 Cor 120 - e




BID TABULATION 2014-02

CULVERTS, VARIOUS TYPES
January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

EST Woodson Wholesale| Comtech Engineered CPR Services and
ITEM QTY e Caldwell. TX Solutions Supply New
NO IN FEET : ’ Houston, TX Caney, TX
Galv Steel Corr Culv & Corr Poly Plast Pipe STOCK I ORDER | STOCK | ORDER | STOCK | ORDER
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $132.12 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $97.00 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $103.08 $85.18 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $85.18 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair _ _ $2,371.13 $2,080.25 No Bid
s — . Alluminum Corrugated Culvert & Pi - s
9 15" 14 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 200
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $23.00 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $13.91 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $17.63 $12.75 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $12.75 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $144.33 $127.70 No Bid
10 [18" 14 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 200
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $27.77 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $16.80 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $22.09 $14.12 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid - $1412 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $164.95 $139.00 No Bid
11 24" 12 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $50.50 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $30.27 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $29.87 $26.90 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $26.90 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $268.04 $239.50 No Bid
12 36" 12 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $76.05 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $48.11 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination [ $38.97 $41.40 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid - $41.40 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $541.24 $495.00 No Bid
13 |48" 12 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $99.98 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $61.15 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination [ $66.11 $51.15 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $51.15 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $1,020.62 $82.00 No Bid
14 60" 10 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 500
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $191.90 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $120.22 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $123.78 $107.00 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $107.00 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Pair $2,164.95 $1,975.00 No Bid
15 72" 10 Guage Round Spiral Culvert 500




BID TABULATION 2014-02

CULVERTS, VARIOUS TYPES
January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

EST Contech Engineered | CPR Services and
ITEM QTy ‘:\:'?ds?am‘:; s:;(e Solutions Supply New
NO IN FEET " ' Houston, TX Caney, TX
Galv Steel Corr Culv & Corr Poly Plast Pipe STOCK I ORDER | STOCK | ORDER | STOCK | ORDER
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $230.22 No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $141.12 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $236.08 $129.13 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $129.13 No Bid
Sloped Ends, Palr [$3, 195 87 $2,870.00 No Bid

4145 :

30" Steel Remforced Polyethyiene Duromaxx Storm

" Steel Reinforced P

Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $34.15 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier
17 36" Steel Reinforced Polyethylene Duromaxx Storm| 240 e
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $43.27 No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid $44.00 No Bid
18 42" Steel Reinforced Polyethylene Duromaxx Storm| 120
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination No Bid $52.11 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $53.94 No Bid
19 48" Steel Reinforced Polyethylene Duromaxx Storm| 192
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination No Bid  $59.29 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid . $61.52 No Bid
20 60" Steel Reinforced Polyethylene Duromaxx Storm| 192
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $81.68 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $84.28 No Bid
21 72" Steel Reinforced Polyethylene Duromaxx Storm| 192
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination No Bid ~ $133.89 No Bid
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid $138.80 No Bid
= — Dual Wall Polypropylene Impact Modified Co-Polymer Culvert and Pj =
22 15" ADS N 12 HP Storm Pipe 120
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No bid No Bid $8.25
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $8.21
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination | $8.32 No Bid - $8.47
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $8.13
23 18" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 200




BID TABULATION 2014-02

CULVERTS, VARIOUS TYPES
January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

EST Contech Engineered | CPR Services and
ITEM QTYy \:\:‘Zwsoé'am:zlﬁs:;f Solutions Supply  New
NO IN FEET i . Houston, TX Caney, TX
Galv Steel Corr Culv & Corr Poly Plast Pipe STOCK ] ORDER | STOCK I ORDER | STOCK | ORDER
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No bid No Bid $10.53
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $10.47
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $10.61 No Bid - $10.42
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $10.36
24  |24" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 160
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No bid No Bid - $16.08
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $16.00
Truck Load, F.0.B. Destination [ $16.21 No Bid $15.92
Truck Load, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid  $15.83
25 30" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 160 1T -
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination
Truck Load, F.0.B. Supplier
26 36" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 160
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Destination
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier
27  |42" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 120
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier
28 48" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 120
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No bid No Bid $51.32
Single Pipe, F.0.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $51.05
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $51.71 No Bid $50.79
Truck Load, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $50.52
29  |60" ADS N-12 HP Storm Pipe 120
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Destination No bid No Bid | $82.54
Single Pipe, F.O.B. Supplier No Bid No Bid $82.11
Truck Load, F.O.B. Destination | $83.16 No Bid $81.68
Truck Load, F 0 B Suppher No Bid No Bid - $81.25
T Hugger Bands - Re-Rolled = =
30 15 Poly Hugger Band Re-RoIled 36 $9.73 $24.98 No Bid
31 18" Poly Hugger Band Re‘RoIIed 36 $11.53 $29.95 No Bid
32__|24" Poly Hugger Band Re-Rolled 24 $15.40 $37.27 No Bid
33__[36" Poly Hugger Band Re-Rolled 24 $23.20 $60.19 No Bid
34 |48" Poly Hugger Band Re-Rolled 24 !a30.40 $109.97 No Bid
- _____ Aluminum Htﬂger Band - Re-Rolled _ e -
35 15" Alumlnum gger Band Re Rolled No Bid $40.95 No Bid
36 18" Aluminum Hugger Band Re-Rolled 36 No Bid $47.98 No Bid




BID TABULATION 2014-02

CULVERTS, VARIOUS TYPES
January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Recommendation:
Primary Vendors:

EST Contech Engineered | CPR Services and
ITEM QTYy VI:ZOds?a‘I’::‘v:lﬁ s.?;(e Solutions Supply New
NO IN FEET : 2 Houston, TX Caney, TX
Galv Steel Corr Culv & Corr Poly Plast Pipe STOCK | ORDER | STOCK | ORDER | sTOCK | ORDER
37__|24" Aluminum Hugger Band Re-Rolled 24 No Bid $90.15 No Bid |
38 36" Aluminum Hugger Band Re—Ro[led 24 NoTBid $129.97 No Bid
39 [48" Alumlnum Hugger Band Re-Rolled 24 No Bid $180.97 No Bid
- : : mse e Waands_. ' e i e e
20 [15" Flat Band 24 $19.45 | $16.17 No Bid
41 |18" Flat Band 24 $23.05 | $20.19 No Bid
42 |24" Flat Band 24 $30.80 | $25.13 No Bid
43 . |30" Flat Band 24 $38.40 | $31.19 No Bid
44 36" Flat Band 36 $46.40 | $40.00 No Bid
a5 |48 Flat Band 24 $60.74 | $76.17 No Bid
46 |84" Flat Band 24 No Bid $178.81 No Bid
mE . ~ Aluminum Flat Bands s B e
a7 ]15" Aluminum Flat Band 24 $36.00 $26.90 No Bid
48 |18" Aluminum Flat Band 24 $45.12 $33.14 No Bid
29 |24" Aluminum Flat Band 24 $60.99 $60.91 No Bid
50 30" Aluminum Flat Band 24 No Bid $76.30 No Bid
51 |36 Aluminum Flat Band 36 $79.58 $90.75 No Bid
52 |48" Aluminum Flat Band 24 $135.01 $121.00 No Bid
53 |84" Aluminum Flat Band 24 No Bid $248.00 No Bid

Contech Engineered Solutions: Items 1- 21, 35-44, 46-50, 52 &53

CPR Services and Supply: Items 22-29

Woodson Wholesale: Primary Award for ltems 30-34, 45, & 51.

Secondary Vendor:

olesale: Items 1-4 & 12

on this \ day of \ X LLMOPY', 2013 by

olding the position of




